

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: Annual Contract for Co Term Maintenance Renewals for Solar Winds Orion, Engineers Toolset, Patch Manager, VNQM and Network Configuration Manager
 TIME & DATE: (Date of Award through March 8, 2016)
 3:00 p.m., June 1, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Accudata Systems 7906 N. Sam Houston Parkway W #300 Houston, TX 77064	Loop1 Systems 912 Capital of TX Hwy Austin, TX 78746	Barrera Enterprises, LLC P.O. Box 5312 Austin, TX 78763	NWN Corporation 4802 N. Sam Houston Parkway West, Suite 500 Houston, TX 77086	SHI Government Solutions 1301 S. Mo-Pac Expressway Austin, TX 78746	Cima Solutions Group
1.	1 ea. SolarWinds Network Performance Monitor SLX (unlimited elements-Standard Polling Throughput) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16083 Start Date: 5/31/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	3,876.04 3,876.04 3,876.04	5,620.00 5,620.00 5,620.00	5,620.00 5,620.00 5,620.00	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
2.	1 ea. SolarWinds Network Configuration Manager DL500 (up to 500 nodes) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16092 Start Date: 5/24/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	1,184.00 1,184.00 1,184.00	1,675.00 1,675.00 1,675.00	1,675.00 1,675.00 1,675.00			
3.	1 ea. SolarWinds NetFlow Traffic Analyzer Module for SolarWinds Network Performance Monitor SLX - Annual Maintenance, Product SKU 16088 Start Date: 5/31/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	2,255.27 2,255.27 2,255.27	3,270.00 3,270.00 3,270.00	3,270.00 3,270.00 3,270.00			
4.	1 ea. SolarWinds VoIP and Network Quality Manager IP SLA X, IP Phone X (unlimited IP SLA source devices, unlimited IP phones) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16099 Start Date: 5/31/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	1,755.25 1,755.25 1,755.25	2,545.00 2,545.00 2,545.00	2,545.00 2,545.00 2,545.00			
5.	2 ea. Engineer's Toolset - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 3003 Start Date: 5/24/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	279.21 558.42 558.42	395.00 790.00 790.00	395.00 790.00 790.00			
6.	1 ea. SolarWinds patch Manager PM4000 (up to 4000 nodes) - Annual Maintenance Renewal Product SKU 16046 Start Date: 5/31/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	2,206.31 2,206.31 2,206.31	3,199.00 3,199.00 3,199.00	3,199.00 3,199.00 3,199.00			
7.	1 ea. Engineer's Toolset - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 3003 Start Date: 5/31/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	272.43 272.43 272.43	395.00 395.00 395.00	395.00 395.00 395.00			
8.	5 ea. SolarWinds DameWare Remote Support [formerly DameWare NT Utilities] Per Seat License (4 to 5 user price) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 11670 Start Date: 5/31/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	41.04 205.20 205.20	59.50 297.50 297.50	59.50 297.50 297.50			
9.	10 ea. SolarWinds DameWareMini Remote Control Per Seat License (10 to 14 user price) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 11572 Start Date: 5/31/2015 End Date: 3/8/2016	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	22.07 220.70 220.70	32.00 320.00 320.00	32.00 320.00 320.00			
	TOTAL YEAR 1	TOTAL	12,533.62	18,111.50	18,111.50			
1.	1 ea. SolarWinds Network Performance Monitor SLX (unlimited elements-Standard Polling Throughout) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16083 Start Date: 3/9/2016 through 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	4,979.39 4,979.39 4,979.39	5,620.00 5,620.00 5,620.00	5,620.00 5,620.00 5,620.00	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID	
2.	1 ea. SolarWinds Network Configuration Manager DL500 (up to 500 nodes) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16092 Start Date: 3/9/2016 through 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	1,484.06 1,484.06 1,484.06	1,675.00 1,675.00 1,675.00	1,675.00 1,675.00 1,675.00			

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: Annual Contract for Co Term Maintenance Renewals for Solar Winds Orion, Engineers Toolset, Patch Manager, VNQM and Network Configuration Manager
 TIME & DATE: (Date of Award through March 8, 2016)
 3:00 p.m., June 1, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Accudata Systems 7906 N. Sam Houston Parkway W #300 Houston, TX 77064	Loop1 Systems 912 Capital of TX Hwy Austin, TX 78746	Barrera Enterprises, LLC P.O. Box 5312 Austin, TX 78763	NWN Corporation 4802 N. Sam Houston Parkway West, Suite 500 Houston, TX 77086	SHI Government Solutions 1301 S. Mo-Pac Expressway Austin, TX 78746	Cima Solutions Group
3.	1 ea. SolarWinds NetFlow Traffic Analyzer Module for SolarWinds Network Performance Monitor SLX - Annual Maintenance, Product SKU 16088 Start Date: 3/9/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	2,897.25 2,897.25 2,897.25	3,270.00 3,270.00 3,270.00	3,270.00 3,270.00 3,270.00	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
4.	1 ea. SolarWinds VoIP and Network Quality Manager IP SLA X, IP Phone X (unlimited IP SLA source devices, unlimited IP phones) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16099 Start Date: 3/9/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	2,258.29 2,258.29 2,258.29	2,545.00 2,545.00 2,545.00	2,545.00 2,545.00 2,545.00			
5.	2 ea. Engineer's Toolset - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 3003 Start Date: 3/9/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	349.97 699.94 699.94	395.00 790.00 790.00	395.00 790.00 790.00			
6.	1 ea. SolarWinds patch Manager PM4000 (up to 4000 nodes) - Annual Maintenance Renewal Product SKU 16046 Start Date: 3/9/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	2,844.32 2,844.32 2,844.32	3,199.00 3,199.00 3,199.00	3,199.00 3,199.00 3,199.00			
7.	1 ea. Engineer's Toolset - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 3003 Start Date: 3/8/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	349.97 349.97 349.97	395.00 395.00 395.00	395.00 395.00 395.00			
8.	5 ea. SolarWinds Dame Ware Remote Support [formerly DameWare NT Utilities] Per Seat License (4 to 5 user price) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 11670 Start Date: 3/9/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	52.91 264.55 264.55	59.50 297.50 297.50	59.50 297.50 297.50			
9.	10 ea. SolarWinds DameWareMini Remote Control Per Seat License (10 to 14 user price) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 11572 Start Date: 9/9/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	28.45 284.50 284.50	32.00 320.00 320.00	32.00 320.00 320.00			
10.	1 ea. SolarWinds Serv-U Managed File Transfer Server Per Seat License (1 server) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 7255 Start Date: 2/14/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	568.96 568.96 568.96	599.00 599.00 599.00	599.00 599.00 599.00			
11.	1 ea. SolarWinds Serv-U Gateway) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 7265 Start Date: 2/14/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	237.46 237.46 237.46	250.00 250.00 250.00	250.00 250.00 250.00			
12.	1 ea. SolarWinds Additional polling Engine for SolarWinds Unlimited Licenses (Standard Polling Throughout) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 7264 Start Date: 3/8/2016 End Date: 3/8/2017	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	3,100.16 3,100.16 3,100.16	3,499.00 3,499.00 3,499.00	3,499.00 3,499.00 3,499.00			
			*					
	TOTAL YEAR 2	TOTAL	19,968.85	22,459.50	22,459.50			
1.	1 ea. SolarWinds Network Performance Monitor SLX (unlimited elements-Standard Polling Throughout) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16083 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	4,979.39 4,979.39 4,979.39	5,620.00 5,620.00 5,620.00	5,620.00 5,620.00 5,620.00			

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: Annual Contract for Co Term Maintenance Renewals for Solar Winds Orion, Engineers Toolset, Patch Manager, VNQM and Network Configuration Manager
 TIME & DATE: (Date of Award through March 8, 2016)
 3:00 p.m., June 1, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Accudata Systems 7906 N. Sam Houston Parkway W #300 Houston, TX 77064	Loop1 Systems 912 Capital of TX Hwy Austin, TX 78746	Barrera Enterprises, LLC P.O. Box 5312 Austin, TX 78763	NWN Corporation 4802 N. Sam Houston Parkway West, Suite 500 Houston, TX 77086	SHI Government Solutions 1301 S. Mo-Pac Expressway Austin, TX 78746	Cima Solutions Group
2.	1 ea. SolarWinds Network Configuration Manager DL500 (up to 500 nodes) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16092 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	1,484.06 1,484.06 1,484.06	1,675.00 1,675.00 1,675.00	1,675.00 1,675.00 1,675.00	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
3.	1 ea. SolarWinds NetFLOW Traffic Analyzer Module for SolarWinds Network Performance Monitor SLX - Annual Maintenance, Product SKU 16088 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	2,897.25 2,897.25 2,897.25	3,270.00 3,270.00 3,270.00	3,270.00 3,270.00 3,270.00			
4.	1 ea. SolarWinds VoIP and Network Quality Manager IP SLA X, IP Phone X (unlimited IP SLA source devices, unlimited IP phones) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 16099 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	2,258.29 2,258.29 2,258.29	2,545.00 2,545.00 2,545.00	2,545.00 2,545.00 2,545.00			
5.	2 ea. Engineer's Toolset - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 3003 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	349.97 699.94 699.94	395.00 790.00 790.00	395.00 790.00 790.00			
6.	1 ea. SolarWinds patch Manager PM4000 (up to 4000 nodes) - Annual Maintenance Renewal Product SKU 16046 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	2,844.32 2,844.32 2,844.32	3,199.00 3,199.00 3,199.00	3,199.00 3,199.00 3,199.00			
7.	1 ea. Engineer's Toolset - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 3003 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	349.97 349.97 349.97	395.00 395.00 395.00	395.00 395.00 395.00			
8.	5 ea. SolarWinds Dame Ware Remote Support [formerly DameWare NT Utilities] Per Seat License (4 to 5 user price) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 11670 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	52.91 264.55 264.55	59.50 297.50 297.50	59.50 297.50 297.50			
9.	10 ea. SolarWinds DameWareMini Remote Control Per Seat License (10 to 14 user price) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 11572 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	28.45 284.50 284.50	32.00 320.00 320.00	32.00 320.00 320.00			
10.	1 ea. SolarWinds Serv-U Managed File Transfer Server Per Seat License (1 server) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 7255 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	532.58 532.58 532.58	599.00 599.00 599.00	599.00 599.00 599.00			
11.	1 ea. SolarWinds Serv-U Gateway) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 7265 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	222.28 222.28 222.28	250.00 250.00 250.00	250.00 250.00 250.00			
12.	1 ea. SolarWinds Additional polling Engine for SolarWinds Unlimited Licenses (Standard Polling Throughout) - Annual Maintenance Renewal, Product SKU 7264 Start Date: 3/9/2017 through 3/8/2018	UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE TOTAL	3,100.16 3,100.16 3,100.16	3,499.00 3,499.00 3,499.00	3,499.00 3,499.00 3,499.00			
	TOTAL YEAR 3	TOTAL	19,917.29	22,459.50	22,459.50			
	TOTAL YEAR 1		12,533.62					
	EXTENSION 1		19,968.85					
	EXTENSION 2		19,917.29					

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: Annual Contract for Co Term Maintenance Renewals for Solar Winds Orion, Engineers
 TIME & DATE: Toolset, Patch Manager, VNQM and Network Configuration Manager
 (Date of Award through March 8, 2016)
 3:00 p.m., June 1, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	Accudata Systems 7906 N. Sam Houston Parkway W #300 Houston, TX 77064	Loop1 Systems 912 Capital of TX Hwy Austin, TX 78746	Barrera Enterprises, LLC P.O. Box 5312 Austin, TX 78763	NWN Corporation 4802 N. Sam Houston Parkway West, Suite 500 Houston, TX 77086	SHI Government Solutions 1301 S. Mo-Pac Expressway Austin, TX 78746	Cima Solutions Group
	Terms	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days			
	Delivery Days						

***LOW BIDDER**

BIDS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Accudata Systems
 Barrera Enterprises
 Blackwood Associates, Inc.
 Cambium Networks
 CDW-G
 CIMA Solutions Group, Ltd.
 Computer Solutions
 Convergence Technologies, Inc.
 Corona Technical Services, LLC
 Data Hardware Depot

Genesis Networks, Inc.
 GovConnection
 Howard Technology Solutions
 Immix Technology, Inc.
 Insight Government Sales
 Intech Southwest Services
 InterCall a Subsidiary of West Corporation
 Joshua Wagne
 Loop1 Systems, Inc.
 Lumenate

Presidio Networked Solutions
 Prosperitus Solutions
 Questyme
 SHI GS
 Sigma Solutions, Inc.
 Sirius Computer Solutions, Inc.
 Solutions II
 Storage Assessments
 Tech Depot
 Technology Integration Group

Demandstar
 SAWS Website